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This volume documents the drafting, negotiation and signature of the treaty that has been the cornerstone of
European defence for the past sixty-five years: the North Atlantic Treaty signed in April 1949.

The story begins at the end of 1947, when the British Foreign Secretary, Ernest Bevin, became convinced of
the need to persuade the United States of America, which had emerged from the Second World War as the
pre-eminent global military and economic power and one of the only two superpowers, to underwrite the
future security of Western Europe. It progresses through the negotiation of the Brussels Treaty of March
1948—an essential prerequisite to securing American participation in a wider defensive system—and ends
with the signature of the North Atlantic Treaty after a series of setbacks, difficulties and security threats. The
documents, drawn from the archives of the Foreign and Commonwealth Office, the Cabinet Office and No.
10 (with some transferred into the public domain for the first time), demonstrate how diplomatic skills and
determination, inspired by Bevin’s vision, led to a system of collective security that played an indispensable
part in the preservation of peace between East and West for the rest of the twentieth century.

This book will be of much interest to students of the Cold War, European and American history, British
political history, international history and IR in general.
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From reader reviews:

Judy Chisolm:

As people who live in the modest era should be up-date about what going on or info even knowledge to
make these individuals keep up with the era that is always change and advance. Some of you maybe will
update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice in your case but the problems coming to anyone is
you don't know which one you should start with. This The Brussels and North Atlantic Treaties, 1947-1949:
Documents on British Policy Overseas, Series I, Volume X (Whitehall Histories) is our recommendation to
help you keep up with the world. Why, because this book serves what you want and need in this era.

Ida Hamilton:

Beside this The Brussels and North Atlantic Treaties, 1947-1949: Documents on British Policy Overseas,
Series I, Volume X (Whitehall Histories) in your phone, it may give you a way to get nearer to the new
knowledge or facts. The information and the knowledge you are going to got here is fresh from the oven so
don't be worry if you feel like an previous people live in narrow village. It is good thing to have The Brussels
and North Atlantic Treaties, 1947-1949: Documents on British Policy Overseas, Series I, Volume X
(Whitehall Histories) because this book offers for your requirements readable information. Do you
occasionally have book but you rarely get what it's about. Oh come on, that won't happen if you have this in
your hand. The Enjoyable agreement here cannot be questionable, similar to treasuring beautiful island.
Techniques you still want to miss that? Find this book along with read it from right now!

Robert Shelby:

This The Brussels and North Atlantic Treaties, 1947-1949: Documents on British Policy Overseas, Series I,
Volume X (Whitehall Histories) is fresh way for you who has interest to look for some information because
it relief your hunger info. Getting deeper you onto it getting knowledge more you know or you who still
having tiny amount of digest in reading this The Brussels and North Atlantic Treaties, 1947-1949:
Documents on British Policy Overseas, Series I, Volume X (Whitehall Histories) can be the light food for
you personally because the information inside that book is easy to get by simply anyone. These books build
itself in the form that is certainly reachable by anyone, yes I mean in the e-book web form. People who think
that in book form make them feel tired even dizzy this publication is the answer. So there is absolutely no in
reading a e-book especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for anyone. So ,
don't miss the idea! Just read this e-book style for your better life and also knowledge.

Michael Blossom:

A lot of e-book has printed but it differs. You can get it by web on social media. You can choose the most
effective book for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever simply by searching from it. It is called of book
The Brussels and North Atlantic Treaties, 1947-1949: Documents on British Policy Overseas, Series I,
Volume X (Whitehall Histories). You can add your knowledge by it. Without departing the printed book, it



could add your knowledge and make anyone happier to read. It is most significant that, you must aware
about e-book. It can bring you from one place to other place.
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