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The Ship fled a dying Earth to save the human race.

Launched as the last gasp of humanity, the Ship set out to preserve the species by seeding the universe with
one billion colonists. Generations of Crew, trained to be either Flight or Marines, have spent 5,000 years
protecting the Ship and its civilian cargo from the constant threat of alien violence.

Fifteen-year-old Zax has always had trouble fitting in with the other cadets, but he's finally on the cusp of
attaining his dream and gaining entrance to the Pilot Academy. Catching the eye of the Flight Boss and
winning him as a mentor should guarantee Zax a top spot, unless the shocking discovery he makes along the
way destroys not only his career, but also the Ship itself.

PRAISE FOR LANDFALL:

"This guy knows how to tell a story!" - Amazon Reviewer

"An engaging and completely believable world and story that sucks you in and doesn't let go!" - Amazon
Reviewer

"Loved it! Nerdy sci-fi that's like a cross between Battlestar Galactica and Ender's Game" - Goodreads
Reviewer

"Engaging story and characters, hard to put down!" - Amazon Reviewer

"This book was so much fun! The world is cool and engaging." - Amazon Reviewer

"My fifth grader read this book in almost one sitting. She loved it so much, I read it myself. This book
rocks." - Amazon Reviewer

"Compelling sci-fi--even for those who aren't always fans of the genre" - Amazon Reviewer
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From reader reviews:

Mark Carter:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Sure, you
can choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare time to
take a go walking, shopping, or went to the actual Mall. How about open or even read a book called
Landfall: The Ship Series // Book One? Maybe it is to be best activity for you. You recognize beside you can
spend your time along with your favorite's book, you can smarter than before. Do you agree with it has the
opinion or you have some other opinion?

Diana Elliott:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading behavior give you
lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge your information inside the book
which improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on what kind of e-book you read,
if you want attract knowledge just go with education books but if you want really feel happy read one
together with theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. The actual Landfall: The Ship Series //
Book One is kind of publication which is giving the reader erratic experience.

Ralph Capra:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them family members
or their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just watching TV, as well
as playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity that's look different you can read
the book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can spent all day every day
to reading a guide. The book Landfall: The Ship Series // Book One it doesn't matter what good to read.
There are a lot of individuals who recommended this book. These folks were enjoying reading this book.
When you did not have enough space to bring this book you can buy the e-book. You can m0ore very easily
to read this book from a smart phone. The price is not too costly but this book possesses high quality.

Carrie Mathis:

Is it you who having spare time in that case spend it whole day by means of watching television programs or
just telling lies on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Landfall: The Ship Series // Book One
can be the answer, oh how comes? A book you know. You are consequently out of date, spending your extra
time by reading in this new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these textbooks have than the others?
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